
The Executive Committee serves as a steering committee that vets and prioritizes issues
related to the overall functional and financial health of the Village for the full board to
address. The committee is comprised of the board Chair, Vice Chair(s), Secretary,
Treasurer, and the immediate past board Chair.

The Governance Committee defines the structures and policies that support good
functioning and organizational integrity. 

The Health and Wellbeing Committee develops programs for the Village community and
their families that help navigate all aspects of well-being - mental, emotional, and
physical -  including preventive measures such as brain health and fitness; and chronic or
progressive conditions such as memory loss and heart disease.

The Investment Committee oversees and safeguards the financial health of the Village by
managing our long-term investments and savings.

The LGBTA Committee (the A is for Ally) builds social cohesion within the broader
community, develops engaging educational and social events, and explores the unique
issues of aging faced by LGBTQ+ individuals. 

The Life 3.0 Committee creates opportunities for members and potential members to
make new connections and explore the city as they transition into later life. 

The Marketing Committee  develops marketing and communications strategies and
materials to expand and deepen understanding of the Village. These activities support 
member acquisition and retention, fund-raising, volunteer growth, and strategic
partnerships/collaborations 

The Member Experience Committee helps attract, integrate, and retain a robust
membership community by exploring and recommending ways for members to always
feel surrounded by welcome, acceptance, choices, support, growth, and entertainment.

Program Committee Encourages and supports members in developing social and
educational events for the community.

Research Committee oversees the application of research to the well-being of the Village
community. 

The Resources Development Committee oversees The Village’s fundraising activities,
encourages board participation in fundraising, and assists staff in soliciting funds from
appropriate constituencies and in stewardship of donors. This Committee also oversees
The Village’s annual fundraising event, operated by the Fundraiser Committee, a
sub-committee of the RDC.


